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Husky & JAWS Professional Disinfectants Effective Against 2019 Novel Coronavirus (2019-nCoV)

The list of disinfectant products below meets the EPA Emerging Pathogen Policy. Each disinfectant is 
listed by name, the EPA registration number and the corresponding non-enveloped virus(es): 

 Husky 319 Everyday Non-Acid E/N/A Disinfectant Cleaner (EPA Registration #6836-152) has 
demonstrated effectiveness against viruses similar to SARS-CoV-2 on hard, non-porous surfaces. 
Therefore, Husky 319 Everyday Non-Acid E/N/A Disinfectant Cleaner can be used against SARS-
CoV-2 when used in accordance with the directions for use against Norovirus.  

Husky 800 Neutral Disinfectant Cleaner (EPA Registration #47371-131) has demonstrated 
effectiveness against viruses similar to SARS-CoV-2 on hard, non-porous surfaces. Therefore, Husky 
800 Neutral Disinfectant Cleaner can be used against SARS-CoV-2 when used in accordance with the 
directions for use against Adenovirus. 

Husky 802 High Fragrance Detergent Disinfectant (EPA Registration #10324-167) has 
demonstrated effectiveness against viruses similar to SARS-CoV-2 on hard, non-porous surfaces. 
Therefore, Husky 802 High Fragrance Detergent Disinfectant can be used against SARS-CoV-2 when 
used in accordance with the directions for use against Human Coronavirus. 

Husky 803 S/V Disinfectant (EPA Registration #6836-70) has demonstrated effectiveness against 
viruses similar to SARS-CoV-2 on hard, non-porous surfaces. Therefore, Husky 803 S/V Disinfectant 
can be used against SARS-CoV-2 when used in accordance with the directions for use against 
Norovirus. 

Husky 805 Neutral Disinfectant 128 (EPA Registration #47371-130) has demonstrated effectiveness 
against viruses similar to SARS-CoV-2 on hard, non-porous surfaces. Therefore, Husky 805 Neutral 
Disinfectant 128 can be used against SARS-CoV-2 when used in accordance with the directions for use
against Adenovirus. 

 Husky 806 Neutral Disinfectant 256 (EPA Registration #47371-129) has demonstrated effectiveness 
against viruses similar to SARS-CoV-2 on hard, non-porous surfaces. Therefore, Husky 806 Neutral 
Disinfectant 256 can be used against SARS-CoV-2 when used in accordance with the directions for use
against Adenovirus. 

Husky 814 Q/T Tuberculocidal Spray Disinfectant Cleaner (EPA Registration #1839-83) has 
demonstrated effectiveness against viruses similar to SARS-CoV-2 on hard, non-porous surfaces. 
Therefore, Husky 814 Q/T Tuberculocidal Spray Disinfectant Cleaner can be used against SARS-CoV-
2 when used in accordance with the directions for use against Canine Parvovirus. 

Husky 815 HCD Disinfectant (EPA Registration #10324-214) has demonstrated effectiveness against 
viruses similar to SARS-CoV-2 on hard, non-porous surfaces. Therefore, Husky 815 HCD Disinfectant 
can be used against SARS-CoV-2 when used in accordance with the directions for use against Human 
Coronavirus.



Husky 820 Hospital Disinfectant Concentrate (EPA Registration #1839-95) has demonstrated 
effectiveness against viruses similar to SARS-CoV-2 on hard, non-porus surfaces. Therefore, Husky 
820 Hospital Disinfectant Concentrate can be used against SARS-CoV-2 when used in accordance with
the directions for use against Norovirus. 

Husky 824 Quick Care Disinfectant (EPA Registration #6836-348) has demonstrated effectiveness 
against viruses similar to SARS-CoV-2 on hard, non-porous surfaces. Therefore, Husky 824 Quick 
Care Disinfectant can be used against SARS-CoV-2 when used in accordance with the directions for 
use against Feline calicivirus; Enterovirus. 

Husky 890 Veterinary Disinfectant Cleaner (EPA Registration #1839-100) has demonstrated 
effectiveness against viruses similar to SARS-CoV-2 on hard, non-porous surfaces. Therefore, Husky 
890 Veterinary Disinfectant Cleaner can be used against SARS-CoV-2 when used in accordance with 
the directions for use against Feline calicivirus; norovirus.  

 

Husky 891 Arena Disinfectant (EPA Registration #1839-166) has demonstrated effectiveness against 
viruses similar to SARS-CoV-2 on hard, non-porous surfaces. Therefore, Husky 891 Arena Disinfectant
can be used against SARS-CoV-2 when used in accordance with the directions for use against 
Rotavirus.

 Husky 892 Arena Plus Disinfectant (EPA Registration #6836-365) has demonstrated effectiveness 
against viruses similar to SARS-CoV-2 on hard, non-porous surfaces. Therefore, Husky 892 Arena Plus
Disinfectant can be used against SARS-CoV-2 when used in accordance with the directions for use 
against Norovirus.  

JAWS 3805 Disinfectant Cleaner (EPA Registration #1839-166) has demonstrated effectiveness 
against viruses similar to SARS-CoV-2 on hard, non-porous surfaces. Therefore, JAWS 3805 
Disinfectant Cleaner can be used against SARS-CoV-2 when used in accordance with the directions for
use against Rotavirus.

JAWS 9080 Disinfectant Cleaner (EPA Registration #47371-129) has demonstrated effectiveness 
against viruses similar to SARS-CoV-2 on hard, non-porous surfaces. Therefore, JAWS 9080 
Disinfectant Cleaner can be used against SARS-CoV-2 when used in accordance with the directions for
use against Adenovirus.

 Please refer to the CDC website for additional information. 

https://www.cdc.gov/coronavirus/2019-ncov/index.html

